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Overview

Truman by David McCullough is a Pulitzer Prize-winning biography of the
33rd President of the United States. The book provides a comprehensive
and insightful look at Truman's life and presidency, from his humble
beginnings in Missouri to his tumultuous years in the White House.
McCullough's masterful storytelling and meticulous research make Truman
a must-read for anyone interested in American history.

The Early Years

Truman was born in Lamar, Missouri, in 1884. His father was a farmer and
his mother was a homemaker. Truman had a difficult childhood, marked by
poverty and the death of his father when Truman was just six years old.
Despite these challenges, Truman persevered and went on to graduate
from high school and college.
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Early Political Career

After college, Truman worked as a farmer and a bank clerk. He entered
politics in 1922, when he was elected to the Jackson County Court. Truman
served in the county court for eight years, and during that time he
developed a reputation for honesty and hard work. In 1934, Truman was
elected to the United States Senate.

Vice Presidency and Presidency

Truman served as vice president under Franklin D. Roosevelt from 1945 to
1949. When Roosevelt died in 1945, Truman became president. Truman
faced a number of challenges during his presidency, including the end of
World War II, the Cold War, and the Korean War. However, he also
presided over a period of great economic growth and prosperity.

Legacy

Truman is considered one of the most successful presidents in American
history. He is remembered for his leadership during World War II and the
Cold War, as well as for his domestic policies, which helped to create a
more prosperous and just society.

Truman by David McCullough is a masterful biography of one of America's
most important presidents. McCullough's meticulous research and
engaging storytelling bring Truman to life, and provide a fascinating glimpse
into the presidency during one of the most turbulent periods in American
history.

If you are interested in American history, I highly recommend reading
Truman by David McCullough. It is a book that will stay with you long after
you finish it.
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